
                        Good-bye holiday and hello school  
 
 
 
         In the summer holiday of the year 2004, I had lots of fun, and I did many interesting 
things, but unfortunately, the holiday is over. 
         I will always remember the times when I was in Iasi with Lizi visiting Simona. The 
Metropolitan seat and the Three Hierarch were very beautiful, and even the libraries were 
very beautiful, but I was very sorry that`` H arry Potter 6  ``hadn’t appeared in Romania.  
          I think I enjoyed the most the pot fair. It was full of plates, pots, sculptures in wood 
and knifes. I had bought a bracelet that I still like to wear. Rest all I did was to sleep and 
read ``The way round the Earth in 80 days`` by Jules Verne, a book that I still like. 
           Moreover, I will never forget the trip to The White Source were I was with my 
friends from the karate club and with the coach Paul Pintilie. We played soccer, we swam 
and we made a campfire. I remember that the fire wasn’t burning and the couch Paul had 
to call a friend of his to help him. After that, I remember that the other boys and myself, 
went into the tent and told different jokes. After that, we bought couple of juices and 
chocolate and talked until 12:30 pm hours and then we went to sleep. 
               We were supposed to stay to The White Source three days, but the next morning 
when we realized that it was raining the coach called the ship  
                Last, I will never forget the vacation in Eforie with Alex and his parents. When 
we arrived the hotel that we had planed to stay did not emptied the room until 6:00 pm. 
So we accommodated in another hotel. At night, we went to see how Eforie Nord is. At 
night, the shops were full of people. I had bought a Beyblade and so did Alex. After that, 
we went to the hotel and played cards because we had no T.V., but we still had fun. 
                 The next days were rainy, so we couldn’t stay at the sun. We just went at a 
show that I enjoyed very much. 
                  The next day the water that was could become warmer from the rain. 
Therefore, we could stay in the water more than five minutes. The rest of the day, we 
played pool, after that we ate something for dinner, we played cards and we went to bed. 
                   The other day we were in the vacation village and we had great fun in the 
cars, we played pool and bowling. 
                    My opinion is that the greatest place we had ever been was in Aqua Land. 
The water slides were great. I specially liked a black one when you slide on it you 
couldn’t see anything. 
                    After that, we went home and we didn’t stop anywhere. When I arrived 
home, I told mom what a great time I had and I went to bed. 
                    I will never forget these wonderful memories that I lived in the vacation.    
                           
                       
 


